
REQUEST FOR BOARD ACTION 
 

HENDERSON COUNTY  
BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 

 
 

MEETING DATE: January 19, 2005 
 
SUBJECT: Request for Extension of Improvement Guarantee for a Portion of 

Riverwind, Phase IV 
 
ATTACHMENTS: 1. Memo from G. Thomas Jones, III, P.E. 
  2. Original Performance Guarantee Agreement 
  3. Draft of Performance Guarantee Agreement for Extension 
  
SUMMARY OF REQUEST: 
On November 1, 2004, the Board of Commissioners approved an application submitted 
by Carrollwood Development, LLC, (Developer), for an improvement guarantee for a 
portion of the proposed Phase IV of Riverwind subdivision.  The improvement 
guarantee covers the grading and construction of roads and the installation of water and 
sewer system improvements to serve lots 1-5, 32 and 46-49 in Phase IV of the 
development. 
 
As required by the Performance Guarantee Agreement for the improvement guarantee, 
the Developer posted with Henderson County an irrevocable letter of credit in the 
amount of $212,500.00 that includes the cost of the remaining improvements as well as 
the required twenty-five percent (25%) contingency.  The proposed completion date for 
the improvements was January 15, 2005. 
 
The Planning Department has received notification from G. Thomas Jones, P.E., of 
William G. Lapsley & Associates (agent for the Developer), requesting that the County 
extend the completion date for the improvements specified in the original Agreement 
until April 15, 2005.  Section 170-39 of the Subdivision Ordinance allows the Board of 
Commissioners “upon proof of difficulty” to grant extensions to completion dates for 
improvement guarantees for a maximum of one additional year, provided that the time 
between initiation and completion of the improvements does not exceed two years.  The 
memorandum from Mr. Jones notes that all of the required improvements have been 
completed except for the paving of the roads.   
 
In addition to the request for the extension of the improvements completion deadline, 
the Developer would also like to have the flexibility to convert the improvement 
guarantee from an irrevocable letter of credit to another financing method.  The 
Developer will probably be requesting a partial release of the letter of credit in an 
amount equal to the cost of the improvements that have already been completed.  In the 
event that such a reduction is requested, the Developer believes it would be easier to 
then post a certified check or cash, for example, rather than post an amended letter of 
credit, to cover the cost of the remaining work under the improvement guarantee.  
 
If the Board of Commissioners agrees to extend the completion date and allow for a 
change in the form of the improvement guarantee at a later date, staff has attached for 
the Board’s consideration a draft Performance Guarantee Agreement.  The draft 
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Agreement reflects a new improvements completion date of April 15, 2005, and requires 
submittal of an amendment to the irrevocable letter of credit showing an expiration date 
not earlier than 60 days after such new improvements completion date.  It also allows 
for the replacement of the letter of credit with some other equivalent, permitted form of 
improvement guarantee provided the Developer notifies the Planning Department in 
writing of its desire to do so and such new form of improvement guarantee is approved 
by the (Acting) County Attorney.  The new Performance Guarantee Agreement must be 
executed by the relevant parties if the Board approves this request.   
 
COUNTY MANAGER’S RECOMMENDATION/BOARD ACTION REQUESTED: 
The extension, if granted, would not cause the developer to exceed the two-year 
maximum time period for completion of the required improvements.  Therefore, I 
recommend that the Board approve the request to extend the completion date for the 
improvement guarantee for lots 1-5, 32 and 46-49 in Riverwind, Phase IV, and allow the 
substitution of the letter of credit with some other acceptable form of improvement 
guarantee, both in accordance with the terms the draft Performance Guarantee 
Agreement. 




























